Joe Colangelo

From: Martha Q. Keenan <mgk@windnrg.com>
Sent: Friday, November 09, 2012 10:28 AM

To: Carl Ruprecht

Cc: Joe Colangelo

Subject: RE: Sidewalk

Hi Carl,

The expectation is that the grant will cover the cost of bridge. | go before the Select Board Monday night, November
12" for the Town to accept the grant award. After that, we will be assigned a project manager from VTRans and start
the work on it

Worst case is that we will be constructing in 2014, best case is fall of 2013. My understanding is that the timeframe
depends on how quickly it can move the various departments in VTRans.

Once we have an engineer picked, | would like to meet with you and they on your property to look at siting the sidewalk
and how to make it works best for all. | am imagining this will be in January at the earliest.

if you would like to meet prior to this please let me know and we can do so.

Best,
Martha

Martha Q. Keenan

From: Carl Ruprecht [mailto:cruprecht@sbciolley.com]
Sent: Friday, November 09, 2012 9:51 AM

To: Martha Q. Keenan

Subject: Sidewalk

I'm impressed to see that your efforts to land a grant were successfull Do you feel the amount is sufficient to
cover the cost of a bridge, too? What do you suppose the schedule will be for this work?

Thank you,
Carl
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