Joe Colangelo

From: Beauregard, Rachel <Rachel.Beauregard@state.vt.us>
Sent: Monday, January 06, 2014 12:09 PM

To: 'Joe Colangelo’

Subject: RE: Summer FEMA

Hi joe,

{ just got your last hydraulic report back today, so FEMA should have everything we need. 'd assume they can put
{ogether all of your reports pretiy quickly as all they need to do is push it through the queue, then they'lisend you a
final sheet saying they've written up all of the projects. After that we’ll go for a ride around to make sure all of the work
is complete and fill out the project completion form and when Montpelier receives that form they can start dispersing
funds. Quite the process, right!? Let me know if you have any more questions.

Thanks,

Rachel Beauregard

Vermont Agency of Transportation
District 5 Technician IV

P.0O.Box 168

Essex jct., VT (05453

Office: (802) 654-0971

Cell: (802) 363-1182

From: Joe Colangelo [mailto:jcolangelo@hinesburg.org]
Sent: Friday, January 03, 2014 3:11 PM

To: Beauregard, Rachel

Subject: Summer FEMA

Where are we with FEMA reimbursements from this past summer?
.joe..

Joe Colangelo

Town Administrator

Town of Hinesburg, VT

10632 Rte 116

Hinesburg, VT 05461

(w) 802.482.2281x221

(M) 802.355.6848

jcolangelo@hinesburg.org
www.hinesburg.org
http://www.facebook.com/townofhinesburg




